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e FOrwarded message ---e------
From: Hamblett, Sarah <HambleSa@collier.k12.fl.us>

Date: Thu, Aug 6, 2009 at 1:56 PM

Kasia,

| have begun processing your request and have determined that approximately 25 t
necessary to gather the requested records, at a cost of approximately $350.00. Ity
produce most of the records electronically in pdf format. If you wish for us to proce
will do so upon receipt of a check made out to the District School Board of Collier €
$350.00. If the information exceeds this amount, we will request the additional mor
documents. If $350.00 turns out to be too much, a refund will be issued for the djff
as to your wishes regarding this request.

Thank you,

Sarah Hamblett

239-377-0180

I ofl 9/3/2009 10:52 AM



